
Re: fm Aecolux, order acknowledgement Nov.08 (Supreme LED)
From supreme led <supremeled2001@gmail.com>
To Aecolux Sales Order Desk <sales@aecolux.com>
Date 2021-11-08 13:57

yes please ship it

On Mon, Nov 8, 2021 at 2:56 PM supreme led <supremeled2001@gmail.com> wrote:

Confirmed! 



On Mon, Nov 8, 2021 at 2:45 PM Aecolux Sales Order Desk <sales@aecolux.com> wrote:


Hi Zishan, 

Thanks for your order over the phone. Please see below for detailed pricing & ETDs.

For the power supply, it's A50150 the same black one you purchased back in April (your invoice# 35000375), pls confirm again.

Back order:

A30333 & A45049 ETA Dec.07
A49112 & A49110 ETA Jan.14, 2022

Please confirm and we'll ship out whatever in stock on Wednesday. Thank you.

And yes, we've received your e-transfer payment with many thanks. Will send the receipt soon.

Cheers,



Janice Wong

Sales Order Desk / Accounting

Aecolux Technology Ltd.

Email: sales@aecolux.com ; accounting@aecolux.com

T: 604-370-1060 ext. 9

#120 - 13431 Maycrest Way, Richmond, BC V6V 2M3 Canada




On 2021-11-08 12:34, supreme led wrote:

 
-- 

 





-- 

Best Regards



Supreme LED

Lighthing up your future

supremeled.ca

PH: 587-350-2020 
Address : 6-3700 19 St NE
Calgary AB T2E 6V2



-- 

Best Regards
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